Bid Tabulation
03935-NTT-00-GS-MA

Bidder Name Lead Acid total| Dry Cell total | Speciality total| Bid total
Interstate Battery $15,125.64 $514.65 $628.28| $16,268.57
O"Reilly - Ozark Automotive $18,448.26 $1,251.85 $759.50( $20,459.61
Evco dba Burgoon No bid $470.66|No Bid $470.66
Midway Auto $18,666.62 $644.30 $1,351.28| $20,662.20
Continental Battery $13,560.23|No Bid $1,039.82| $14,600.05
Metroplex Battery $13,628.54 $575.00 $1,062.36| $15,265.90
Stationary Power Systems No bid $722.50|No Bid $722.50
TKC Ent. Dba Batteries Plus $13,528.31 $547.30 $1,709.60| $15,785.21
Battery Power Group $21,481.00 $641.95 $820.70| $22,943.65
BID ANALYSIS
TKC Ent. Dba Batteries Plus low bidder (two groups)
Continental Battery low bidder (one groups)
Metroplex Battery overall low bidder
Award Scenario (Award by Group)
TKC Ent. Dba Batteries Plus $13,528.31  Lead Acid
TKC Ent. Dba Batteries Plus $547.30 Dry Cell
Continental Battery $1,039.82 Specialty Batteries
$15,115.43 Bid Total
Award Scenario (Award by Overall low)
Metroplex Battery $15,265.90  Note: Dry cell bid did not include Lantern Batteries

the cost would have added approx. $25.00 to their tabulation
when compared to costs provided by other bidders

Senior Buyers Recommendation

Award to Metroplex is the most practical option in my opinion
fragmenting the award by group could save about $450.00 over three
years, but having two vendors is somewhat harder to manage.
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